
Evaluation Rubric for Written Summaries of Journal Articles 
 

Criteria Outstanding Very Good Good Satisfactory Unacceptable 
Appropriate details 
 

Judicious choice of details 
maximizes interest and 
understanding 

All relevant details 
presented, but details not 
critical to understanding 
omitted 

Enough critical details 
presented for understanding, 
unneccesary details 
generally omitted 

Most important details 
included but may include 
too much or too little detail 
for easy understanding 

Some critical details 
missing, unnecessary details 
may be present 

Statement of context, 
relevance in field of 
animal behavior 

Place of study in field 
clearly described, 
illuminating links to other 
studies or topics made 

Place of study in field 
clearly described, some 
reference to relationship to 
other studies or topics 

General relevance of study 
in field described 

Attempt made to place in 
context, possibly not quite 
appropriately 

No attempt made to 
describe context of study 

Writer's evaluation of 
the study 
 

Clearly articulated, well 
supported statements of 
value and/or shortcomings 
of study  

Evaluation includes positive 
value of study as well as 
clearly supported 
explanation of shortcomings 

Good attempt at evaluation 
with some support for 
conclusions; possibly more 
negative than positive 
comments 

Some attempt at evaluation, 
comments valid but not 
necessarily well supported 

No attempt to evaluate 
study or evaluative 
statements unsupported or 
inappropriate 

Overall  organization 
 



 Evaluation Rubric for Laboratory Rotation Reports 
 

 
Criteria Outstanding Very Good Good Satisfactory Unacceptable 

Categorization of 
behaviors 

Fine attention to details of 
behavior, very clearly 
described allowing 
objective identification, 
organized in categories 
allowing a number of 
questions to be addressed 
through quantitative study 

Clear descriptions of several 
behaviors allow objective 
identification, organized in 
meaningful categories, 
useful in generating 
research questions 

Descriptions of several 
behaviors mostly clear and 



Evaluation Rubric for Research Project  
 

Criteria Outstanding Very Good Good Satisfactory Unacceptable 



Evaluation Rubric for Research Project (continued) 
 
Teamwork (if 



Evaluation Rubric for Review Paper 
 



Clarity of explanations 
 

Sophisticated use of 



Evaluation Rubric for Presentations of Journal Articles 
 

Criteria Outstanding Very Good Good Satisfactory Unacceptable 
Appropriate details 
 

Judicious choice of details 
maximizes interest and 
understanding 

All relevant details 
presented, but details not 
critical to understanding 
omitted 

Enough critical details 
presented for understanding, 
unneccesary details 
generally omitted 

Most important details 
included but may include 
too much or too little detail 
for easy understanding 

Some critical details 
missing, unnecessary details 
may be present 

Statement of context, 
relevance in field of 
animal behavior 

Place of study in field 
clearly described, 
illuminating links to other 
studies or topics made 

Place of study in field 
clearly described, some 
reference to relationship to 
other studies or topics 

General relevance of study 
in field described 

Attempt made to place in 
context, possibly not quite 
appropriately 

No attempt made to 
describe context of study 

Presenter's evaluation 
of the study 
 

Clearly articulated, well 
supported statements of 
value and/or shortcomings 


